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(Korean rapper) Won Ki-nam (Hangul:
윤기남; born March 13, 1987) is a Korean
rapper. He won first place on Mnet's M!

Countdown. Early life and career In order
to become a rapper, he put up his hair
and started singing. On December 20,

2017, Ki Nam's song made into a nonstop
charted by the Gaon Chart and the results

was placed 3rd place. He is the first
Korean MC to make non-stop chart on
Gaon Chart. Discography Single album

Filmography Television series Television
shows References External links
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average temperature for December 2017
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in the city of São Paulo was 19.6°C. The
month of December was very humid in
São Paulo. Temperatures The highest

temperatures were recorded in the month
of January. The lowest temperatures were

recorded in April. The highest monthly
average temperature in December 2017
was 23.2°C. The lowest monthly average

temperature in December 2017 was
-2.5°C. January The highest temperature
recorded in January was 21°C. The lowest

temperature recorded in January was
-3.5°C. February The highest temperature

recorded in February was 19.5°C. The
lowest temperature recorded in February

was -6
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importance in the field of data
communications and processing. It is

desirable that these lasers be monolithic
in construction in order to reduce the

number of components, simplify
manufacture and reduce cost. Typically,

the active elements are distributed in the
monolithic laser structure, and have heat-

dissipating fins. The fins are used to
dissipate heat from the active region of
the laser, and to allow the active region
to be in direct contact with the external

environment. Such monolithic lasers
operate at relatively high temperatures,

on the order of approximately 200
degrees Celsius. Because of the rather
high temperature, the laser generally is

considered a Type II laser, and is
equipped with a temperature-sensitive

control circuit to control the temperature.
One problem associated with monolithic

lasers is leakage current. Leakage current
is often described as the current flow
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through a diode having reverse bias
applied to the device, i.e. when no

electric field is applied to the diode.
Current leakage occurs because the
depletion layer formed around the

junction of the PN junction diode extends
beyond the boundary of
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